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Vaginal dilators have been used in a variety of 
clinical situations for many years, including the 
treatment of vaginismus, and the prevention of 
vaginal adhesion and stenosis following radiation 
therapy (Murino et al. 2008). Specialist women’s 
health physiotherapists may recommend the use 
of vaginal dilators as part of their management 
plan for patients who present with vulvodynia. 
Dilators desensitize the vaginal introitus, and al-

sexual intercourse (Chalmers et al. 2016).
Two of the most commonly recommended 

products are the Amielle Comfort and Femmax 
vaginal dilators. Both sets can be obtained on 
prescription, or purchased privately by patients.

According to the manufacturer’s literature, 
Amielle Comfort dilators have been designed 
for women experiencing vaginal discomfort and 
penetration problems as a result of vaginismus, 
dyspareunia, gynaecological surgery or trauma 

-
lators that graduate in size from 15 to 35 mm 
in diameter. These are attached to a “twist and 

pouch. The set includes a small bottle of Sylk 
vaginal lubricant (see above), a sheet of instruc-
tions and a short educational DVD. The Amielle 
Comfort dilator set can be purchased through 
the StressNoMore website (www.stressnomore.
co.uk).

Femmax vaginal dilators are marketed as 
being “perfect for use after pelvic surgery & 

reduce discomfort during follow up examina-

(FemmaxOnline 2013). The Femmax dilator set 
includes four graduated sizes, which again range 

Comfort dilators, the Femmax ones are all the 
same length (13 cm) and screw together in pairs, 
making a separate handle unnecessary. The set is 

small, discreet plastic box. Like the Amielle set, 
the Femmax one includes an educational DVD, 

lubricant. In comparison to the Amielle Comfort 
dilators, the Femmax set is considerably cheaper, 

Although both sets of vaginal dilators are de-
signed to treat the same conditions, there are 
some subtle differences between the two brands. 
The Amielle Comfort set offers the greatest va-
riety of sizes (15, 20, 25, 30 and 35 mm in di-
ameter), with each dilator becoming longer as 
the diameter increases (the longest being 16 cm 
in length). The Femmax set give less choice in 
terms of diameter (15, 20, 27 and 35 mm), but 
the standardized length of 13 cm may make the 
largest size seem less daunting when women 

Amielle Comfort dilator is more pointed than the 
Femmax one, which may make the initial inser-
tion more comfortable, particularly with regard 
to the larger sizes.

Both sets of dilators require some degree of 
dexterity to assemble. The Amielle Comfort han-

-
ticularly for the mid- range- diameter dilators. The 

-
pecially if the lubricating gel transfers onto the 
handle during use, and becomes lodged between 
the attachment rings when using the mid- range 
sizes. The Femmax dilators attach easily, and 
become a sealed, double- ended unit. There are 
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no areas where lubricating gel could become 
trapped, and therefore, the Femmax set is easier 
to keep clean.

Aesthetically, the Femmax dilators are supe-
rior in both appearance and feel. Although not 
designed as sex toys, these look feminine and 
unobtrusive, and could be used during foreplay 

-
trast, the Amielle Comfort dilators are made 
from white plastic, and resemble a medical de-
vice when attached to the grey plastic handle. 

-
erable, particularly if the thought of sexual inter-
course provokes negative emotions.

Finally, the cost of purchasing a set of Femmax 
dilators is less than half that of the Amielle 
Comfort one. This difference may be partly be-
cause of the inclusion in the Amielle Comfort set 
of a bottle of Sylk lubricant, a product that retails 

Clinically, I have not had any feedback regard-
ing the Femmax dilators; however, my review of 
the Amielle Comfort set is based on patient ex-
perience. Of the two sets of vaginal dilators, I 

believe that the Femmax one is the better prod-
uct, particularly with regard to its ease of use, 
aesthetics and price.
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